
Company Base Bid Add Alt #1 Add Alt #2 Add Alt #3 Ded Alt #1 Ded Alt #2 Ded Alt #3 Ded Alt #4 Ded Alt #5 Base Bid Ded Alt #1

OFFICE INTERIORS 358,197.55$                       28,402.31$                         6,986.97$                           17,626.12$                         3,992.56$                           9,424.95$                           10,068.31$                         15,438.98$                         5,486.82$                           200,442.92$                       see note in cover letter

SOURCE INTERIORS, LLC NO BID -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 168,129.42$                       32,904.38$                         

SPACESAVER STORAGE SOLUTIONS, INC. NO BID -- -- -- -- -- -- -- -- 197,954.00$                       NO BID

C-W-C HOLDINGS, INC. 414,030.70$                       35,033.14$                         9,322.50$                           25,686.00$                         4,580.36$                           14,536.24$                         13,163.82$                         26,843.40$                         8,832.48$                           NO BID NO BID

EMPIRE OFFICE, INC. 347,002.85$                       29,146.82$                         7,267.01$                           17,800.26$                         4,247.93$                           10,477.21$                         10,955.46$                         16,788.18$                         6,839.42$                           200,271.14$                       NO BID

INTERIOR SPACE CONSULTANTS, INC. 309,143.75$                       27,040.50$                         9,660.00$                           17,513.00$                         3,950.00$                           8,446.50$                           9,221.00$                           15,489.00$                         6,590.00$                           NO BID NO BID

FURNITURE SHELVING

Denmark Furniture & Shelving
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